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“HOW YA DOIN’?”

With these four syllables, delivered in an unmistakably authentic New York accent, Steve Osborne has
riveted thousands of people at the legendary storytelling venue The Moth (and many tens of thousands more
via YouTube) with his hilarious, profane, and touching tales from his twenty years as an NYPD street cop.
Steve Osborne is the real deal, people: the tough, streetwise New York cop of your dreams, one with a big,
big heart. Kojak? NYPD Blue? Law & Order? Fuggedaboudem! The Job blows them out of the water.
     Steve Osborne has seen a thing or two in his years in the NYPD—some harmless, some definitely not. In
“Stakeout,” Steve and his partner mistake a Manhattan dentist for an armed robbery suspect, and reduce the
man to a puddle of snot and tears when questioning him. In “Mug Shot,” the mother of a suspected criminal
makes a strange request and provides a sobering reminder of the humanity at stake in his profession. And in
“Home,” the image of Steve’s family provides the adrenaline he needs to fight for his life when assaulted by
two armed and violent crackheads. 
     From stories about his days as a rookie cop to the time spent patrolling in the Anti-Crime Unit—and his
visceral, harrowing recollections of working during the weeks after 9/11—The Job: True Tales from the Life
of a New York City Cop captures the humanity, the absurdity, and the dark humor of police work, as well as
the bravery of those who do it. These stories will speak to those nostalgic for the New York City of the
1980s and ’90s, a bygone era when the city was a crazier, more dangerous (and possibly more interesting)
place.

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Daniel Spencer:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? Yeah, you
can choose the suitable activity regarding spend your time. Any person spent all their spare time to take a
wander, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open or maybe read a book titled The Job: True
Tales from the Life of a New York City Cop? Maybe it is to get best activity for you. You recognize beside
you can spend your time together with your favorite's book, you can better than before. Do you agree with it
has the opinion or you have some other opinion?

Gerardo Whittaker:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray anyone, why because this The Job: True Tales from the Life of a New
York City Cop guide written by well-known writer we are excited for well how to make book that could be
understand by anyone who have read the book. Written with good manner for you, leaking every ideas and
composing skill only for eliminate your own personal hunger then you still skepticism The Job: True Tales
from the Life of a New York City Cop as good book but not only by the cover but also through the content.
This is one e-book that can break don't ascertain book by its handle, so do you still needing a different sixth
sense to pick this specific!? Oh come on your reading through sixth sense already said so why you have to
listening to yet another sixth sense.

Robert Brown:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside with friends, fun activity along with family or just
watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by reading through a
book. Ugh, do you think reading a book can actually hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It
all right you can have the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like The Job: True
Tales from the Life of a New York City Cop which is obtaining the e-book version. So , try out this book?
Let's view.

Walter Pyle:

This The Job: True Tales from the Life of a New York City Cop is brand-new way for you who has intense
curiosity to look for some information given it relief your hunger info. Getting deeper you in it getting
knowledge more you know or perhaps you who still having little bit of digest in reading this The Job: True
Tales from the Life of a New York City Cop can be the light food for you personally because the information
inside this book is easy to get by simply anyone. These books acquire itself in the form and that is reachable
by anyone, sure I mean in the e-book contact form. People who think that in book form make them feel
drowsy even dizzy this publication is the answer. So you cannot find any in reading a e-book especially this
one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for anyone. So , don't miss the item! Just read
this e-book variety for your better life along with knowledge.
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