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Professional organizers seems to be born, not made. Before we joined the ranks of NAPO the people who
call themselves "professional organizers" were educated in other careers, had jobs they loved or hated but
left for various reasons. We seem to have always had the knack for organizing (although our clients call it
our "gift") but truly and really, not one among us thought about turning Professional Organizing into a full or
part-time career. And, sometimes, suddenly or with a lot of thought, a recession happens, a new family is
started, a parent dies ... and these experiences plant seeds of change. As it is often at these critical junctures,
that a professional organizer is born. So join us on our journey - before the Big O - and read our stories about
how Professional Organizers got here. This book is written for the person who has the gift of organizing but
isn't sure where to turn to hone and apply that gift.
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From reader reviews:

Paulette Stoneman:

Here thing why that Before the Big O: Professional Organizers Talk about Life before Organizing are
different and reliable to be yours. First of all looking at a book is good nonetheless it depends in the content
of computer which is the content is as delicious as food or not. Before the Big O: Professional Organizers
Talk about Life before Organizing giving you information deeper and different ways, you can find any
reserve out there but there is no reserve that similar with Before the Big O: Professional Organizers Talk
about Life before Organizing. It gives you thrill reading through journey, its open up your eyes about the
thing this happened in the world which is probably can be happened around you. It is possible to bring
everywhere like in park your car, café, or even in your method home by train. Should you be having
difficulties in bringing the printed book maybe the form of Before the Big O: Professional Organizers Talk
about Life before Organizing in e-book can be your choice.

Joseph Bolden:

Typically the book Before the Big O: Professional Organizers Talk about Life before Organizing will bring
you to the new experience of reading a book. The author style to explain the idea is very unique. When you
try to find new book to learn, this book very suitable to you. The book Before the Big O: Professional
Organizers Talk about Life before Organizing is much recommended to you you just read. You can also get
the e-book from official web site, so you can more readily to read the book.

Edward Cottrell:

Before the Big O: Professional Organizers Talk about Life before Organizing can be one of your beginning
books that are good idea. Many of us recommend that straight away because this book has good vocabulary
that can increase your knowledge in terminology, easy to understand, bit entertaining but still delivering the
information. The article writer giving his/her effort to set every word into enjoyment arrangement in writing
Before the Big O: Professional Organizers Talk about Life before Organizing but doesn't forget the main
stage, giving the reader the hottest and based confirm resource facts that maybe you can be certainly one of
it. This great information may drawn you into brand-new stage of crucial considering.

Ryan Strausbaugh:

Is it you who having spare time and then spend it whole day through watching television programs or just
laying on the bed? Do you need something new? This Before the Big O: Professional Organizers Talk about
Life before Organizing can be the reply, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are thus out of date,
spending your spare time by reading in this brand new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these
books have than the others?
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