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This is the story of Santos Alvarez, a boy of privilege raised in the upper class of Cuban colonial society in
the early eighteenth century. His life changes abruptly when his loving father dies under mysterious
consequences, and he finds that his family has been plagued with an ancient curse for centuries. Santos is
then kidnapped by a bloodthirsty gang of pirates and forced to join their crew. The pirate's vessel is attacked
by the Spanish, and Santos is thrown into the sea. He then finds himself shipwrecked on the desolate beaches
of Southeast Florida, where he encounters the ancient people known as the Ais. Forced to assimilate or die,
he befriends a man who's uncanny survival skills change his life forever. Santos and his men overcome all to
become the most feared pirates in all of the Caribbean. The story includes an account of the famous 1715
Plate Fleet disaster in which an entire treasure fleet was lost on Florida's rocky east coast in a terrible
hurricane. This is a story of innocence lost, romance, ghostly curses, survival, and triumph, all presented on a
backdrop of the beautiful and forbidden coast of eighteenth century South Florida.
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From reader reviews:

Harold Sparkman:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book to study? May be the book with the name The Pirate Santos:
Curse of the Treasure Coast suitable to you? The book was written by popular writer in this era. The book
untitled The Pirate Santos: Curse of the Treasure Coastis the one of several books that everyone read now.
That book was inspired a lot of people in the world. When you read this e-book you will enter the new
dimension that you ever know previous to. The author explained their concept in the simple way, so all of
people can easily to recognise the core of this publication. This book will give you a large amount of
information about this world now. In order to see the represented of the world in this particular book.

Barbara Shephard:

The actual book The Pirate Santos: Curse of the Treasure Coast will bring that you the new experience of
reading the book. The author style to elucidate the idea is very unique. When you try to find new book you
just read, this book very ideal to you. The book The Pirate Santos: Curse of the Treasure Coast is much
recommended to you to read. You can also get the e-book through the official web site, so you can more
readily to read the book.

Theodore Pritchard:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you, why because this The Pirate Santos: Curse of the Treasure Coast
guide written by well-known writer whose to say well how to make book that may be understand by anyone
who read the book. Written throughout good manner for you, leaking every ideas and creating skill only for
eliminate your own personal hunger then you still question The Pirate Santos: Curse of the Treasure Coast as
good book not only by the cover but also through the content. This is one reserve that can break don't
ascertain book by its include, so do you still needing another sixth sense to pick this kind of!? Oh come on
your reading through sixth sense already told you so why you have to listening to another sixth sense.

Kirby Paradiso:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher requested them to go to the library or even
make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just small students that has reading's internal or real
their leisure activity. They just do what the educator want, like asked to go to the library. They go to right
now there but nothing reading seriously. Any students feel that reading through is not important, boring in
addition to can't see colorful photos on there. Yeah, it is to become complicated. Book is very important for
you personally. As we know that on this period, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says,
ways to reach Chinese's country. Therefore , this The Pirate Santos: Curse of the Treasure Coast can make
you feel more interested to read.
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