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In the wake of urbanization and technological advances, public green spaces within cities are disappearing
and people are spending more time with electronic devices than with nature. Urban Horticulture explores
the importance of horticulture to the lives, health, and well-being of urban populations. It includes
contributions from experts in research and practice from across the United States, discussing the history,
importance, and benefits of selected topics in urban horticulture.

This book examines types of public and private communities as well as state and federal programs to
promote urban horticulture, including their history, management and administration, programming,
evaluation, funding, and the benefits they provide to individuals and communities. It also reviews past and
current research on school, community, public, and prison gardens. While not a straightforward textbook, it
is adaptable to classroom learning, as each chapter features:

Objectives●

Key terms●

A summary●

Review questions●

Enrichment activities●

Suggestions for further reading●

The book also includes case studies and online access to examples of PowerPoint presentations that can be
used in the classroom or web-based courses.

Useful for researchers, practitioners, teachers, and students, Urban Horticulture is a flexible resource that
details how passive and active interaction with plants enriches people’s lives. It presents several cases that
illustrate how such interactions improve physical and mental health, quality of life, social well-being, and
community growth.
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From reader reviews:

Clarence Hamm:

Book is definitely written, printed, or descriptive for everything. You can recognize everything you want by
a guide. Book has a different type. As you may know that book is important issue to bring us around the
world. Adjacent to that you can your reading expertise was fluently. A publication Urban Horticulture will
make you to be smarter. You can feel far more confidence if you can know about almost everything. But
some of you think this open or reading any book make you bored. It is far from make you fun. Why they are
often thought like that? Have you seeking best book or ideal book with you?

Augusta Wilson:

Now a day individuals who Living in the era wherever everything reachable by connect to the internet and
the resources inside can be true or not call for people to be aware of each details they get. How people have
to be smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the solution is reading a book. Examining a
book can help men and women out of this uncertainty Information specially this Urban Horticulture book
because book offers you rich info and knowledge. Of course the data in this book hundred % guarantees
there is no doubt in it you probably know this.

Brandon Justice:

Precisely why? Because this Urban Horticulture is an unordinary book that the inside of the reserve waiting
for you to snap it but latter it will shock you with the secret it inside. Reading this book next to it was
fantastic author who have write the book in such awesome way makes the content on the inside easier to
understand, entertaining technique but still convey the meaning completely. So , it is good for you for not
hesitating having this any longer or you going to regret it. This phenomenal book will give you a lot of
rewards than the other book get such as help improving your expertise and your critical thinking way. So ,
still want to postpone having that book? If I were being you I will go to the e-book store hurriedly.

John Hawkins:

Do you have something that you enjoy such as book? The guide lovers usually prefer to choose book like
comic, brief story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not striving Urban Horticulture that give your
satisfaction preference will be satisfied through reading this book. Reading routine all over the world can be
said as the opportinity for people to know world a great deal better then how they react towards the world. It
can't be stated constantly that reading habit only for the geeky man but for all of you who wants to become
success person. So , for all of you who want to start examining as your good habit, you may pick Urban
Horticulture become your own starter.
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