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Unlock doors to the lost worlds of the Bible -- from the Garden of Eden to the ruins of Babylon

Did a volcano part the Red Sea? Have scientists found Eve? Was the pharaoh of the Oppression a woman?
Did the Jordan River really cease flowing the day Jericho fell?

A brilliant author, scientist, and adventurer who has been called "the real Indiana Jones," Dr. Charles
Pellegrino takes us on a remarkable journey from the Nile to the Tigris-Euphrates rivers -- crossing time,
legend, and ancient lands to explore the unsolved mysteries of the Old Testament. Return to Sodom and
Gomorrah is an epic saga of discovery that interweaves science, history, and suspense --the first book ever to
bring archaeologists, scientists and theologians together to examine the same evidence. In this enthralling
revelatory adventure, Pellegrino introduces us to dedicated pioneers like Benjamin Mazar, Leonard Woolley,
and T. E. Lawrence, who retraced the steps of Moses to demystify the Exodus and the Flood. In the process,
he enables us to view ancient relics in an extraordinary new light -- as both fascinating windows on the past
and vivid signposts to the future.
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From reader reviews:

Gayle Collins:

Nowadays reading books become more and more than want or need but also become a life style. This
reading behavior give you lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge the rest of
the information inside the book in which improve your knowledge and information. The details you get
based on what kind of guide you read, if you want attract knowledge just go with education books but if you
want really feel happy read one together with theme for entertaining such as comic or novel. The actual
Return to Sodom and Gomorrah is kind of book which is giving the reader unforeseen experience.

Shawn Young:

This book untitled Return to Sodom and Gomorrah to be one of several books which best seller in this year,
that's because when you read this e-book you can get a lot of benefit upon it. You will easily to buy that book
in the book retail outlet or you can order it through online. The publisher of this book sells the e-book too. It
makes you quickly to read this book, because you can read this book in your Cell phone. So there is no
reason to your account to past this guide from your list.

Magdalena McKinney:

Can you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt when you find yourself in the book store?
Make an effort to pick one book that you never know the inside because don't assess book by its deal with
may doesn't work here is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not since fantastic as in
the outside appearance likes. Maybe you answer might be Return to Sodom and Gomorrah why because the
amazing cover that make you consider about the content will not disappoint you actually. The inside or
content is definitely fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly make
suggestions to pick up this book.

Margaret Conley:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will make
someone to understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information much
easier to share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, newspaper,
book, and soon. You will observe that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. The actual book
that recommended to you is Return to Sodom and Gomorrah this publication consist a lot of the information
in the condition of this world now. This kind of book was represented just how can the world has grown up.
The terminology styles that writer require to explain it is easy to understand. The writer made some
investigation when he makes this book. This is why this book suitable all of you.
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