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Two-thirds of the population of the world are poor, and their number is growing in the first as well as in the
third world, despite billions of dollars of aid. The economic development policies of the last two decades,
and the theory which gave rise to them, have been discredited. The rich are disillusioned, apprehensive or
uninterested, while the poor are embittered and without hope, the victims and agents of ignorance, instability
and environmental degradation. The need for radical rethinking is urgent: this book makes an important
contribution towards that end.

John Friedmann argues that poverty should be seen not merely in material terms, but as social, political and
psychological powerlessness. He presents the case for an alternative development committed to empowering
the poor in their own communities, and to mobilizing them for political participation on a wider scale. In
contrast to centralized development policies devised and implemented at the national and international level,
alternative development restores the initiative to those in need, on the grounds that unless people have an
active role in directing their own destinies long-term progress will not be achieved.

The author takes the household as the strategic starting-point - stressing its moral, political and economic
potential - as a source of continuity and as a location for production. From this basis he propounds a politics
of emancipation that would enable the disempowered poor to assert their rights.

Empowerment provides a morally-informed theoretical framework for a development policy that meets the
needs of its recipients rather than of its makers.
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From reader reviews:

John Tibbs:

This Empowerment: The Politics of Alternative Development book is not ordinary book, you have it then the
world is in your hands. The benefit you receive by reading this book is definitely information inside this
publication incredible fresh, you will get data which is getting deeper a person read a lot of information you
will get. This particular Empowerment: The Politics of Alternative Development without we know teach the
one who examining it become critical in imagining and analyzing. Don't always be worry Empowerment:
The Politics of Alternative Development can bring when you are and not make your bag space or
bookshelves' become full because you can have it in your lovely laptop even cellphone. This Empowerment:
The Politics of Alternative Development having excellent arrangement in word as well as layout, so you will
not experience uninterested in reading.

David Unruh:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind
talent or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book compared to
can satisfy your limited time to read it because this all time you only find book that need more time to be go
through. Empowerment: The Politics of Alternative Development can be your answer given it can be read by
you who have those short time problems.

Mary Fox:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make someone
to understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information easier to share. You
can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, newspapers, book, and soon. You
can view that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. The actual book that recommended to
your account is Empowerment: The Politics of Alternative Development this e-book consist a lot of the
information from the condition of this world now. This particular book was represented just how can the
world has grown up. The language styles that writer use to explain it is easy to understand. Typically the
writer made some analysis when he makes this book. Here is why this book ideal all of you.

Sylvia Ferland:

With this era which is the greater individual or who has ability to do something more are more important
than other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple way to have that. What you have to do is just
spending your time not much but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books. Among the books in the top
list in your reading list will be Empowerment: The Politics of Alternative Development. This book and that
is qualified as The Hungry Hills can get you closer in turning out to be precious person. By looking upwards
and review this publication you can get many advantages.
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