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Seventy years ago, 11,000 American soldiers landed on a tiny, frozen, snow-swept rock 750 miles east of
Siberia to take back US property—Attu Island. A tiny 35 by 20 mile dot on the map, Attu represented the
end of the Aleutian Island chain at the far reaches of the North Pacific Ocean. Captured by 3,000 Japanese
Imperial Army infantry and engineers months before, this virtually unknown battle would become one of the
most costly in WWII history, with a casualty rate only surpassed by the invasion of Iwo Jima, two years
later. At the end of the two and a half week battle, nearly 4,000 Americans would be dead, wounded or
environmental casualties—code words for frostbite that would cost hundreds their arms, legs, feet and
fingers. For the Japanese defenders, it would portend the brutal reality of future island campaigns, with all
their men dead, with the exception of 28 survivors. First Among Men is a fictionalized account of the battle
no one ever heard of, remembered and developed because the author, Jerry Coker, listened to his father
slowly unravel and dispel his demons releasing bits and pieces of the story over his lifetime. A regular Army
infantryman with the US Army’s 7th Infantry Division in May of 1943, his father could not forget the
horrors of those bloody weeks in the snow and freezing rain. A combat veteran himself as a US Marine
rifleman during the Vietnam War, Jerry Coker decided, after shelving a corporate and business career, the
story needed to be told. After ten months of meticulous research and another six writing, the story captures a
battle that would be characterized later in official Army records as a battle of honor over an island nobody
wanted. This is a painful, yet poignant tale of incredible suffering and sacrifice, where the two sides not only
fought one another, but faced constant rain, wind, snow, and some of the toughest terrain in the world.
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From reader reviews:

Christina Epp:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time?
Yeah, you can choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent their particular
spare time to take a walk, shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or perhaps read a book titled First
Among Men: The Story of the Invasion of Attu Island? Maybe it is to become best activity for you. You
realize beside you can spend your time along with your favorite's book, you can cleverer than before. Do you
agree with its opinion or you have some other opinion?

Trevor Wright:

This book untitled First Among Men: The Story of the Invasion of Attu Island to be one of several books
which best seller in this year, honestly, that is because when you read this guide you can get a lot of benefit
into it. You will easily to buy this kind of book in the book store or you can order it by means of online. The
publisher of the book sells the e-book too. It makes you more easily to read this book, since you can read this
book in your Smart phone. So there is no reason to you personally to past this publication from your list.

Carol Ray:

Does one one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store? Try
and pick one book that you never know the inside because don't ascertain book by its cover may doesn't
work is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not because fantastic as in the outside look
likes. Maybe you answer is usually First Among Men: The Story of the Invasion of Attu Island why because
the wonderful cover that make you consider regarding the content will not disappoint you. The inside or
content is definitely fantastic as the outside as well as cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly guide you
to pick up this book.

James Anderson:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher asked them to go to the library as well as to
make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just tiny students that has reading's heart and soul or
real their pastime. They just do what the professor want, like asked to the library. They go to there but
nothing reading seriously. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring along with can't see
colorful photographs on there. Yeah, it is to be complicated. Book is very important for you personally. As
we know that on this age, many ways to get whatever we want. Likewise word says, many ways to reach
Chinese's country. So , this First Among Men: The Story of the Invasion of Attu Island can make you truly
feel more interested to read.
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