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Michael and Justin have both been hurt in the past, but when these two solitary, lonely shifters find each
other, they must decide if they’re willing to risk everything for love. Lynn Tyler presents Michael’s Heart,
Book 4 of her paranormal romance series, Pack Mates.

Michael Ferris lives a solitary life, even as a werewolf within the confines of the Smooth Rock Falls pack.
Not willing to risk getting hurt again, he's built an impenetrable wall around his heart that only a few had
even a chance of chipping away at. His job as a firefighter helps to keep his mind off his solitude for a while,
but when he meets the right guy, Michael doesn't know if he can let him in.

Justin Blake isn't lonely by choice. In fact, he's not even aware of just how lonely he is until he lays eyes on
the handsome firefighter. As the shifter negotiator, Justin finds himself hopelessly drawn to Michael while
helping to ease new shifters onto pack lands.

Can two hurting, lost souls heal each other, or will fear keep them apart even as the Smooth Rock Falls pack
grows larger?

Content Notes: Hot, Anal Play, Anal Intercourse, GBLT, Paranormal, Shifters, M/M, Wolves, Other Weres,
Contemporary
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From reader reviews:

Jerold Richards:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important take action, like
looking for your favorite e-book and reading a book. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add your
knowledge by the e-book entitled Michael's Heart (Pack Mates series Book 4). Try to stumble through book
Michael's Heart (Pack Mates series Book 4) as your good friend. It means that it can to become your friend
when you feel alone and beside those of course make you smarter than ever. Yeah, it is very fortuned for
you. The book makes you a lot more confidence because you can know every thing by the book. So , we
need to make new experience in addition to knowledge with this book.

Jon Gomes:

This Michael's Heart (Pack Mates series Book 4) are reliable for you who want to be a successful person,
why. The reason why of this Michael's Heart (Pack Mates series Book 4) can be one of the great books you
must have is usually giving you more than just simple reading through food but feed an individual with
information that perhaps will shock your preceding knowledge. This book is definitely handy, you can bring
it everywhere and whenever your conditions throughout the e-book and printed ones. Beside that this
Michael's Heart (Pack Mates series Book 4) forcing you to have an enormous of experience for example rich
vocabulary, giving you trial run of critical thinking that could it useful in your day pastime. So , let's have it
appreciate reading.

Lula Day:

Reading a book to become new life style in this yr; every people loves to study a book. When you examine a
book you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge, because
book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of book that you
have read. If you wish to get information about your examine, you can read education books, but if you want
to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, such us novel, comics, in addition to soon. The Michael's Heart
(Pack Mates series Book 4) will give you a new experience in reading through a book.

Amy Joshi:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that will question when you got scholars? We believe that that issue
was given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every individual has different hobby. And also
you know that little person including reading or as looking at become their hobby. You have to know that
reading is very important and book as to be the point. Book is important thing to provide you knowledge,
except your teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update concerning something by book. Amount
types of books that can you decide to try be your object. One of them is actually Michael's Heart (Pack
Mates series Book 4).
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