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As America moves closer to normalizing relations with Cuba, this gripping, vivid graphic novel reveals life
and times of Fidel Castro, one of the twentieth century's most intriguing, charismatic, and divisive figures.
The book is narrated by a German journalist named Karl Mertens, who is plunged into the searing heat of
pre-revolutionary Cuba in the mid-1950s. He first meets with Castro while the latter is hiding in the
mountains, then follows him through the dramatic revolution and his ascent to the presidency that, despite
the Bay of Pigs confrontation and years of international trade blockades, lasts for nearly fifty years. We also
witness his involvement in bloody skirmishes, failed missions, and brutal crackdowns, as well as his
interactions with and on behalf of the Cuban people, which reveal as much about his fallible human qualities
as they do his legend.

Castro is the work of acclaimed German graphic novelist Reinhardt Kleist; it was first published in English
by Selfmade Hero for the British market, and is now being made available in the United States for the first
time. Bristling with energy and alive with the spirit of Cuba, Castro has much to offer about the complex
politics of one of the most enduring and controversial figures in modern history.

Reinhardt Kleist is the author of fourteen books, including two others available in English: The Boxer and
Johnny Cash: I See a Darkness. His many awards include the BZ Cultural Award for outstanding cultural
achievement from the City of Berlin.
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From reader reviews:

Louise Graham:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world enjoys. Do you like reading book and
so. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoy it. First reading a publication will give you a lot of new data.
When you read a reserve you will get new information because book is one of several ways to share the
information or their idea. Second, reading a book will make an individual more imaginative. When you
reading a book especially hype book the author will bring you to imagine the story how the characters do it
anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to others. When you read this Castro: A Graphic Novel,
you can tells your family, friends and soon about yours book. Your knowledge can inspire average, make
them reading a reserve.

Johnny Harper:

Do you have something that you enjoy such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to decide on book
like comic, quick story and the biggest one is novel. Now, why not hoping Castro: A Graphic Novel that give
your fun preference will be satisfied by simply reading this book. Reading habit all over the world can be
said as the opportunity for people to know world much better then how they react to the world. It can't be
explained constantly that reading practice only for the geeky individual but for all of you who wants to
possibly be success person. So , for every you who want to start examining as your good habit, you can pick
Castro: A Graphic Novel become your starter.

Bernetta Smith:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information quicker to
share. You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, newspaper, book, and soon. You
can see that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. Typically the book that recommended to
you personally is Castro: A Graphic Novel this publication consist a lot of the information in the condition of
this world now. This kind of book was represented just how can the world has grown up. The dialect styles
that writer make usage of to explain it is easy to understand. Typically the writer made some analysis when
he makes this book. Honestly, that is why this book suitable all of you.

Patricia Meyer:

As a student exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the library as
well as to make summary for some book, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's heart or
real their interest. They just do what the teacher want, like asked to the library. They go to at this time there
but nothing reading critically. Any students feel that reading through is not important, boring along with can't
see colorful pics on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important to suit your needs. As we
know that on this time, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, ways to reach
Chinese's country. So , this Castro: A Graphic Novel can make you really feel more interested to read.
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