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The Sixties -- The decade you love to hate or hate to love. Hippies & War; Sex, Drugs, & Rock 'n Roll; Free
love and a man on the moon. Yada-yada-yada.

This novel has been fermenting for way too many years and strangely enough the times seem ripe for a story
about the infamous Sixties. After all, the radicals are the establishment now -- just check the White House
Visitor Log. For me the decade was a flesh wound. I made it out relatively in tact having spent most of my
time with a Gibson SG Special and a series of tube amps of ever increasing size and wattage. History pretty
much kept in my peripheral vision as I was focused on Clapton, Beck, Hendrix, et al.

Later in life, I became a splotch of grease (not even a cog, a nut or a screw) in the Military-Industrial
Complex as I haunted the Special Project Offices at Wright Patterson Air Force Base and the Army's
Aviation Command in St. Louis, not to mention the Engineering Departments at Boeing, Beech Aircraft and
McDonnell-Douglas on behalf of Litton Industries, then the fifth largest defense contractor in America,
which no longer exists today having been swallowed up by Northrup-Grumman in 2001. I survived those
experiences, too -- though not without some (hopefully) cosmetic scarring of the soul.

That being said, In the Black is a work of fiction that attempts to compete with reality for entertainment
value. Just remember what Tom Clancy had to say on the subject: “The difference between fiction and
reality? Fiction has to make sense.”

In the great tradition of Dickens, James, Melville, Wolfe & episodic TV, In the Black is being serialized and
released in six installments during 2013 beginning in January, with follow up parts to be published in March,
May, July, September and November. Dickens liked hearing what readers thought about his characters and
what they thought was going to happen while he was weaving his tale. Sometimes it changed what he wrote.
If you are so moved, let me know what you think on Facebook. I can't promise any re-writes. This thing has
a life of its own.

In 1965 Part 1, as Erp Industries Inc. gets more and more involved with supplying the Vietnam War machine
through military contracts and assisting in NASA's quest to put a man on the moon, young Y.T., Erp, Jr.
flees his Midwest hometown by enrolling in the University of California at Berkeley to quell a minor high
school scandal and to escape being groomed to follow in his father's footsteps -- not to mention simply
getting away from all of the flem brains "working" at his father's company.

As you read, please be advised that the lawyers for Comedy Central and Owl Works neither condone nor
encourage this behavior. Enjoy.
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From reader reviews:

Cathy Spearman:

Spent a free time and energy to be fun activity to accomplish! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their
family, or their own friends. Usually they carrying out activity like watching television, planning to beach, or
picnic within the park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to something
different to fill your free time/ holiday? May be reading a book could be option to fill your totally free time/
holiday. The first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of publication that you should read. If you want to
test look for book, may be the reserve untitled In the Black: 1965 - Part 1 can be great book to read. May be
it can be best activity to you.

Bonnie Lugo:

In the Black: 1965 - Part 1 can be one of your nice books that are good idea. We all recommend that straight
away because this publication has good vocabulary that could increase your knowledge in vocabulary, easy
to understand, bit entertaining however delivering the information. The author giving his/her effort to get
every word into pleasure arrangement in writing In the Black: 1965 - Part 1 although doesn't forget the main
position, giving the reader the hottest and based confirm resource facts that maybe you can be one of it. This
great information could drawn you into brand new stage of crucial contemplating.

Emily Ferrell:

As a university student exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the
library or even make summary for some publication, they are complained. Just minor students that has
reading's spirit or real their pastime. They just do what the educator want, like asked to the library. They go
to at this time there but nothing reading significantly. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring
and can't see colorful photos on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very important to suit your
needs. As we know that on this time, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says, many ways
to reach Chinese's country. Therefore , this In the Black: 1965 - Part 1 can make you feel more interested to
read.

Alberto Kimble:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge from it. You can take knowledge and information
from a book. Book is published or printed or created from each source which filled update of news. Within
this modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for a person. From media social
such as newspaper, magazines, science reserve, encyclopedia, reference book, new and comic. You can add
your understanding by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just
trying to find the In the Black: 1965 - Part 1 when you needed it?
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