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Haley gathers 12 medical outsiders' stories to support his theory that the AMA, FDA, and big pharmaceutical
companies conspire to prevent new ideas from entering medical research and practice. His subjects include
Andrew Ivy, who advocated the discredited anticancer drug Krebiozen; anticancer herbalist Harry Hoxsey;
anticancer blood researcher Gaston Naessens; and antineoplastin researcher Stanislaw Burzynski. Those
persecuted medical investigators are fairly well known, but some of Haley's other cases concern forgotten
men like William Koch, developer of the antipolio drug Glyoxylide, whom many may find more interesting
because of their obscurity. The stories of all 12 are often absent from current medical histories, which alone
makes this book worthwhile. Haley's thesis that many of his subjects were victims of organized medicine,
however, remains unproven. Moreover, his assertion that at least five of the 12 should have been Nobel
laureates strains credibility, and the implication that the AMA controls the decisions of the Nobel
committees seems dubious. --William Beatty, American Library Association.
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From reader reviews:

Alta Valentin:

The book Politics in Healing: The Suppression and Manipulation of American Medicine can give more
knowledge and also the precise product information about everything you want. So why must we leave the
best thing like a book Politics in Healing: The Suppression and Manipulation of American Medicine? A
number of you have a different opinion about book. But one aim which book can give many facts for us. It is
absolutely appropriate. Right now, try to closer along with your book. Knowledge or information that you
take for that, you could give for each other; you can share all of these. Book Politics in Healing: The
Suppression and Manipulation of American Medicine has simple shape however you know: it has great and
large function for you. You can appear the enormous world by available and read a guide. So it is very
wonderful.

Mamie Shaw:

This Politics in Healing: The Suppression and Manipulation of American Medicine book is not really
ordinary book, you have after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you will get by reading this book
is information inside this publication incredible fresh, you will get information which is getting deeper an
individual read a lot of information you will get. This specific Politics in Healing: The Suppression and
Manipulation of American Medicine without we know teach the one who examining it become critical in
pondering and analyzing. Don't always be worry Politics in Healing: The Suppression and Manipulation of
American Medicine can bring once you are and not make your case space or bookshelves' turn out to be full
because you can have it in the lovely laptop even cellphone. This Politics in Healing: The Suppression and
Manipulation of American Medicine having good arrangement in word and also layout, so you will not truly
feel uninterested in reading.

Shirley Arrington:

Hey guys, do you really wants to finds a new book to see? May be the book with the concept Politics in
Healing: The Suppression and Manipulation of American Medicine suitable to you? Typically the book was
written by well known writer in this era. Often the book untitled Politics in Healing: The Suppression and
Manipulation of American Medicineis a single of several books in which everyone read now. This kind of
book was inspired many men and women in the world. When you read this reserve you will enter the new
dimension that you ever know previous to. The author explained their thought in the simple way,
consequently all of people can easily to comprehend the core of this e-book. This book will give you a lots of
information about this world now. To help you see the represented of the world on this book.

Sharon Baker:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make you to
definitely understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information easier to



share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, newspapers, book, and soon.
You can view that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. The book that recommended to you
personally is Politics in Healing: The Suppression and Manipulation of American Medicine this publication
consist a lot of the information with the condition of this world now. This book was represented just how can
the world has grown up. The language styles that writer use to explain it is easy to understand. The actual
writer made some analysis when he makes this book. That's why this book appropriate all of you.
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