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This book is about rethinking your career in a refreshing and systematic way to take into account your
professional and personal goals. The book provides students and information and library professionals (at all
levels) with tools and practical steps to making changes in their career. At the heart of the book is a
methodology called ‘personal strategic planning’, which allows the reader to work out a baseline for what is
important to them in a career and provide techniques and tools for moving forwards.

Written in accessible style from an experienced practitioner’s point of view●

Draws on the author’s experience of moving between different LIS sectors having worked in the private●

and public sector
Draws on the author’s experience of successfully moving and adapting skills from a career in another●

industry sector
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From reader reviews:

Alice Black:

The book Taking Charge of Your Career: A Guide for Library and Information Professionals (Chandos
Information Professional Series) make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You can utilize to make your
capable considerably more increase. Book can for being your best friend when you getting anxiety or having
big problem with your subject. If you can make reading a book Taking Charge of Your Career: A Guide for
Library and Information Professionals (Chandos Information Professional Series) to get your habit, you can
get considerably more advantages, like add your current capable, increase your knowledge about some or all
subjects. You can know everything if you like open up and read a reserve Taking Charge of Your Career: A
Guide for Library and Information Professionals (Chandos Information Professional Series). Kinds of book
are a lot of. It means that, science e-book or encyclopedia or other people. So , how do you think about this
book?

Michael Berry:

Do you considered one of people who can't read enjoyable if the sentence chained inside the straightway,
hold on guys this kind of aren't like that. This Taking Charge of Your Career: A Guide for Library and
Information Professionals (Chandos Information Professional Series) book is readable by means of you who
hate the perfect word style. You will find the data here are arrange for enjoyable studying experience without
leaving actually decrease the knowledge that want to give to you. The writer regarding Taking Charge of
Your Career: A Guide for Library and Information Professionals (Chandos Information Professional Series)
content conveys objective easily to understand by most people. The printed and e-book are not different in
the information but it just different in the form of it. So , do you nevertheless thinking Taking Charge of
Your Career: A Guide for Library and Information Professionals (Chandos Information Professional Series)
is not loveable to be your top checklist reading book?

Jane Pelley:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their leisure time with their family, or
their friends. Usually they performing activity like watching television, gonna beach, or picnic in the park.
They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Do you want to something different to fill your
personal free time/ holiday? Could be reading a book might be option to fill your free of charge time/
holiday. The first thing that you will ask may be what kinds of publication that you should read. If you want
to consider look for book, may be the book untitled Taking Charge of Your Career: A Guide for Library and
Information Professionals (Chandos Information Professional Series) can be very good book to read. May be
it may be best activity to you.

Kelley Hardy:

Many people spending their time by playing outside using friends, fun activity having family or just



watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by reading a book. Ugh,
you think reading a book will surely hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It ok you can have
the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like Taking Charge of Your Career: A Guide
for Library and Information Professionals (Chandos Information Professional Series) which is getting the e-
book version. So , try out this book? Let's observe.
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