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New York City self-help editor Olivia Marks faces her toughest assignment yet: parenthood. When her sister
dies in a car accident, the career-oriented Olivia suddenly becomes the guardian to her four-week-old niece,
Annabelle. She also becomes a challenge for Annabelle’s uncle, Brad Rushford, an old flame whose
gorgeous green eyes bring Olivia’s fevered memories rushing back.

As the two circle each other in their small hometown of Mirror Lake, Olivia finds that Brad is as sexy and
charming as ever?and now he’s the darling of the town as he expands his successful lakefront restaurant. Is
his flirting designed to get serious, or get Olivia to lower her defenses and give up guardianship? What about
the turreted, brick Victorian house Brad tours with a realtor and an attractive, no-strings-attached reporter,
the same place where he and Olivia shared an unforgettable night years ago?is he looking for a future with
Olivia, or planning to start a new life with someone else?

In the first heartwarming Mirror Lake story, steamy trysts and surprising twists lead two people to a future
neither one expected.
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From reader reviews:

Megan Martelli:

What do you concentrate on book? It is just for students since they're still students or the idea for all people
in the world, the actual best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that concern above. Every
person has distinct personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be obligated someone or something that
they don't would like do that. You must know how great and important the book This Thing Called Love (A
Mirror Lake Novel). All type of book would you see on many methods. You can look for the internet sources
or other social media.

Virgie Tauber:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information today can get by anyone from everywhere.
The information can be a knowledge or any news even a huge concern. What people must be consider
whenever those information which is in the former life are challenging to be find than now is taking
seriously which one would work to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you get the
unstable resource then you buy it as your main information it will have huge disadvantage for you. All of
those possibilities will not happen with you if you take This Thing Called Love (A Mirror Lake Novel) as the
daily resource information.

Harry Baxter:

This This Thing Called Love (A Mirror Lake Novel) is great book for you because the content which can be
full of information for you who else always deal with world and get to make decision every minute. That
book reveal it details accurately using great organize word or we can say no rambling sentences included. So
if you are read this hurriedly you can have whole facts in it. Doesn't mean it only gives you straight forward
sentences but hard core information with beautiful delivering sentences. Having This Thing Called Love (A
Mirror Lake Novel) in your hand like getting the world in your arm, details in it is not ridiculous one. We
can say that no reserve that offer you world in ten or fifteen second right but this guide already do that. So , it
is good reading book. Hello Mr. and Mrs. hectic do you still doubt which?

George Hoffman:

A lot of e-book has printed but it differs. You can get it by internet on social media. You can choose the very
best book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It is called of book
This Thing Called Love (A Mirror Lake Novel). Contain your knowledge by it. Without leaving behind the
printed book, it could add your knowledge and make a person happier to read. It is most significant that, you
must aware about reserve. It can bring you from one place to other place.
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