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Seventeen-year-old Annika Truman has never considered "genie" as a career option, but maybe she should
have. She'll do anything to fulfill her little brother's only wish before his cancer surgery. The trouble is, he
wants the actor who plays Teen Robinhood to pay him a visit.

Steve Raleigh is handsome, cocky, and most likely unreachable. Annika has only a few days to drive to
Hollywood and convince him to come home with her. She doesn't expect to find romance, or humor, and she
certainly doesn't expect Steve to understand her better than she understands herself. But life is full of
surprises, both the bad and the good. On a seemingly impossible adventure that includes paparazzi, bows and
arrows, and one enormous snake, Annika learns a few lessons about family, love, and having her own wishes
granted.

Part comedy, part tear-jerker. Teen girls who loved Fault in Our Stars will adore this romance novel with
heart.

Publishers Weekly has called Rallison's YA contemporary romances "Hilarious."
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From reader reviews:

Jean Smith:

Reading a publication can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book
so. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of new facts.
When you read a book you will get new information simply because book is one of several ways to share the
information as well as their idea. Second, reading through a book will make you more imaginative. When
you studying a book especially hype book the author will bring that you imagine the story how the characters
do it anything. Third, you are able to share your knowledge to some others. When you read this Just One
Wish, you are able to tells your family, friends and soon about yours publication. Your knowledge can
inspire the mediocre, make them reading a guide.

Ethel Fung:

The e-book with title Just One Wish has a lot of information that you can understand it. You can get a lot of
benefit after read this book. This specific book exist new know-how the information that exist in this book
represented the condition of the world today. That is important to yo7u to know how the improvement of the
world. This kind of book will bring you with new era of the glowbal growth. You can read the e-book in
your smart phone, so you can read this anywhere you want.

Stephen Hancock:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always aim to and must have the spare time or they will get lots of
stress from both day to day life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have free time, we will say
absolutely of course. People is human not only a robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity are you
experiencing when the spare time coming to you of course your answer can unlimited right. Then do you try
this one, reading textbooks. It can be your alternative throughout spending your spare time, the particular
book you have read is actually Just One Wish.

Jimmy Hostetter:

Is it a person who having spare time and then spend it whole day by means of watching television programs
or just resting on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Just One Wish can be the solution, oh
how comes? It's a book you know. You are and so out of date, spending your spare time by reading in this
new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these textbooks have than the others?
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