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Includes audiobook CD editions of Harper Lee's To Kill a Mockingbird, performed by Sissy Spacek,
and Go Set a Watchman, performed by Reese Witherspoon.

Harper Lee's To Kill a Mockingbird has been beloved by millions for over fifty years, and now following the
release of her second book, Go Set a Watchman, the audiobook editions of both novels are beautifully
packaged together in a limited edition slipcase, just in time for the holiday season.

To Kill a Mockingbird: Through the young eyes of Scout and Jem Finch, Harper Lee explores with rich
humor and unswerving honesty the irrationality of adult attitudes toward race and class in the Deep South of
the 1930s. The conscience of a town steeped in prejudice, violence, and hypocrisy is pricked by the stamina
and quiet heroism of one man's struggle for justice--but the weight of history will only tolerate so much.

Go Set a Watchman: Taking place 20 years after the events of To Kill a Mockingbird, Go Set a Watchman
looks at the characters of the world famous novel as they adjust to the turbulent political events of the mid-
1950s in America. Jean-Louise Finch (known in her childhood as Scout) is making a visit back to Maycomb,
Alabama where she confronts the ghosts of her own past. Moving, funny and compelling, Go Set a
Watchman casts a fascinating light on the famous To Kill a Mockingbird, and stands as a magnificent novel
in its own right.

Now, for the first time ever, these two magnificent audiobooks will be packaged together, becoming the
perfect gift for Harper Lee's millions of fans.
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From reader reviews:

Catherine Walters:

Book is to be different for every grade. Book for children until finally adult are different content. To be sure
that book is very important for all of us. The book Harper Lee Collection: To Kill a Mockingbird + Go Set a
Watchman has been making you to know about other know-how and of course you can take more
information. It is quite advantages for you. The e-book Harper Lee Collection: To Kill a Mockingbird + Go
Set a Watchman is not only giving you a lot more new information but also being your friend when you truly
feel bored. You can spend your spend time to read your publication. Try to make relationship with the book
Harper Lee Collection: To Kill a Mockingbird + Go Set a Watchman. You never sense lose out for
everything if you read some books.

Katherine Sorenson:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be revise about what going on or details even
knowledge to make these individuals keep up with the era which can be always change and move ahead.
Some of you maybe will probably update themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice for yourself but
the problems coming to a person is you don't know what kind you should start with. This Harper Lee
Collection: To Kill a Mockingbird + Go Set a Watchman is our recommendation to make you keep up with
the world. Why, since this book serves what you want and need in this era.

Julie Moore:

The actual book Harper Lee Collection: To Kill a Mockingbird + Go Set a Watchman has a lot associated
with on it. So when you check out this book you can get a lot of benefit. The book was written by the very
famous author. Mcdougal makes some research previous to write this book. That book very easy to read you
can find the point easily after reading this book.

Rosalie Castillo:

Can you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Try to pick
one book that you never know the inside because don't judge book by its protect may doesn't work here is
difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not as fantastic as in the outside appearance
likes. Maybe you answer is usually Harper Lee Collection: To Kill a Mockingbird + Go Set a Watchman
why because the fantastic cover that make you consider in regards to the content will not disappoint you
actually. The inside or content is definitely fantastic as the outside as well as cover. Your reading 6th sense
will directly make suggestions to pick up this book.
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