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The “Ever Present Now,” is a compilation of insights notes, and articles that contain simple reasoning,
current anecdotes, in-depth research, and esoteric spiritual teachings.

Predictions are for doomsayers, but the nuanced perspective of Prophecy, is carefully explained by well-
known mystic and founder of I AM America – Lori Toye – through Prophecy’s inherent gift of hidden
metaphor and its power to guide and change people in unpredictable times.

“The Ever Present Now” is a new way of enlightened thinking and understanding – a valuable skill-set for
the current times. Learn how collective consciousness can morph and reshape drastic Earth Changes through
the Seven Rays of Light and Sound and the Ascended Masters’ network of Golden City Vortices. Familiarize
yourself with the Fourth Dimension and the evolution of Unity Consciousness and personal transcendence –
the Ascension Process.

With her bestselling I AM America Maps, Lori Toye has led and inspired thousands to understand the
ongoing “Time of Change” – a period in Earth’s history of tumultuous change in society, culture, and politics
in tandem with individual and collective spiritual awakenings and transformations. These events occur
simultaneously with the possibilities of massive global warming, climatic changes, and worldwide seismic
and volcanic activity – Earth Changes.

The “Time of Change” is now!
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From reader reviews:

Fanny Rutledge:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in each and every way. By being competitive right now,
people have do something to make these survives, being in the middle of often the crowded place and notice
by means of surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated the item for a while
is reading. Sure, by reading a reserve your ability to survive increase then having chance to remain than other
is high. In your case who want to start reading some sort of book, we give you that The Ever Present Now: A
New Understanding of Consciousness and Prophecy book as beginner and daily reading publication. Why,
because this book is usually more than just a book.

Karen Saldivar:

The reserve untitled The Ever Present Now: A New Understanding of Consciousness and Prophecy is the
guide that recommended to you to learn. You can see the quality of the guide content that will be shown to
anyone. The language that article author use to explained their way of doing something is easily to
understand. The article author was did a lot of investigation when write the book, hence the information that
they share for you is absolutely accurate. You also might get the e-book of The Ever Present Now: A New
Understanding of Consciousness and Prophecy from the publisher to make you more enjoy free time.

Stacie Logan:

The reason? Because this The Ever Present Now: A New Understanding of Consciousness and Prophecy is
an unordinary book that the inside of the reserve waiting for you to snap that but latter it will jolt you with
the secret the item inside. Reading this book adjacent to it was fantastic author who all write the book in such
awesome way makes the content inside easier to understand, entertaining means but still convey the meaning
entirely. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having this any longer or you going to regret it. This
phenomenal book will give you a lot of gains than the other book possess such as help improving your
proficiency and your critical thinking way. So , still want to delay having that book? If I were being you I
will go to the book store hurriedly.

Carmen Bell:

Book is one of source of understanding. We can add our knowledge from it. Not only for students but
additionally native or citizen want book to know the upgrade information of year for you to year. As we
know those publications have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, also can bring us to
around the world. By the book The Ever Present Now: A New Understanding of Consciousness and
Prophecy we can have more advantage. Don't one to be creative people? To become creative person must
like to read a book. Simply choose the best book that acceptable with your aim. Don't end up being doubt to
change your life with that book The Ever Present Now: A New Understanding of Consciousness and
Prophecy. You can more desirable than now.
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