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A very well-written textbook for the treatment of skull base pathology. The high-quality operative, dissection,
and imaging photographs make this an excellent resource for the skull base surgeon. -- Ashutosh Kacker,
MBBS, MD, The Laryngoscope

Ideal for both otolaryngologisthead and neck surgeons and neurosurgeons, Transnasal Endoscopic Skull
Base and Brain Surgery: Tips and Pearls gathers together in one comprehensive volume invaluable advice
from world-renowned authorities on state-of-the-art endoscopic technologies and techniques.

Each succinct chapter begins with a summary of key takeaway points and features an easily accessible
outline format. After uniquely detailed coverage of macroscopic and endoscopic anatomy, the expert authors
discuss the most up-to-date surgical approaches integrated with key information on technologic advances,
such as 3D reconstruction and navigation. Clearly labeled illustrations demonstrate each step of the various
procedures. The book closes with practical guidance on postoperative care and guidelines for avoiding and
managing the potential complications encountered in these complex surgeries.

Features:

In-depth information on endoscopic surgical procedures for the paranasal sinuses, anterior skull base, and●

the craniocervical junction
Easy-to-reference bullet-points in each chapter distill the renowned authors vast experience●

Step-by-step surgical descriptions cover the full spectrum of skull base pathology●

Stunningly detailed illustrations, including more than 500 in full-color, enhance the text throughout●

This landmark work will improve the accuracy and precision of every surgeon and fellow in
otolaryngologyhead and neck surgery and neurosurgery who deals with this delicate anatomic region.
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From reader reviews:

Dorothy Guillen:

Transnasal Endoscopic Skull Base and Brain Surgery: Tips and Pearls can be one of your basic books that
are good idea. Many of us recommend that straight away because this guide has good vocabulary which
could increase your knowledge in vocab, easy to understand, bit entertaining but nonetheless delivering the
information. The writer giving his/her effort to place every word into satisfaction arrangement in writing
Transnasal Endoscopic Skull Base and Brain Surgery: Tips and Pearls however doesn't forget the main
position, giving the reader the hottest as well as based confirm resource info that maybe you can be one
among it. This great information can certainly drawn you into completely new stage of crucial imagining.

Susan Demar:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray anyone, why because this Transnasal Endoscopic Skull Base and
Brain Surgery: Tips and Pearls publication written by well-known writer who really knows well how to
make book which might be understand by anyone who have read the book. Written within good manner for
you, leaking every ideas and publishing skill only for eliminate your own personal hunger then you still
doubt Transnasal Endoscopic Skull Base and Brain Surgery: Tips and Pearls as good book not simply by the
cover but also from the content. This is one book that can break don't evaluate book by its handle, so do you
still needing one more sixth sense to pick that!? Oh come on your looking at sixth sense already told you so
why you have to listening to yet another sixth sense.

Michael Mantz:

That book can make you to feel relax. This book Transnasal Endoscopic Skull Base and Brain Surgery: Tips
and Pearls was multi-colored and of course has pictures on the website. As we know that book Transnasal
Endoscopic Skull Base and Brain Surgery: Tips and Pearls has many kinds or variety. Start from kids until
teenagers. For example Naruto or Detective Conan you can read and believe you are the character on there.
Therefore not at all of book usually are make you bored, any it offers you feel happy, fun and unwind. Try to
choose the best book in your case and try to like reading that will.

Jasper Parsons:

As a pupil exactly feel bored for you to reading. If their teacher requested them to go to the library in order to
make summary for some book, they are complained. Just very little students that has reading's heart and soul
or real their passion. They just do what the professor want, like asked to go to the library. They go to right
now there but nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring in
addition to can't see colorful photos on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important to suit
your needs. As we know that on this age, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says,
many ways to reach Chinese's country. Therefore , this Transnasal Endoscopic Skull Base and Brain
Surgery: Tips and Pearls can make you really feel more interested to read.
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