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This volume brings together ten original essays by leading Chinese law experts in the United States and
beyond. Employing a variety of perspectives and materials, these writings tackle important issues that range
from ancient Chinese legal history to aspects of the contemporary legal process in the People’s Republic of
China. For example, how was law theorized and practiced during China’s Warring States period circa 4th
century B.C? What was the role of case precedents in the Qing (1616-1911) judicial process? What role has
law played in China’s on going transformation from central planning to a market economy? Does the current
practice of village-level elections foretell a greater and more genuine development of democracy in China?
And, given the complexities of its legal tradition, how can one best understand contemporary Chinese law
and anticipate the pace and direction of its future development?

The contributors are William P. Alford, Albert H. Chen, Tsung-fu Chen, Donald C. Clarke, Alison W.
Conner, R. Randle Edwards, Jamie P. Horsley, William C. Jones, Natalie G. Lichtenstein, and Susan
Roosevelt Weld.

This collection of essays is dedicated to Jerome A. Cohen, Professor, New York University Law School, in
honor of his pioneering role during the past forty years in American scholarship on law in China.
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From reader reviews:

Tiara Arnold:

Book is actually written, printed, or created for everything. You can learn everything you want by a e-book.
Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important factor to bring us around the world. Close to that
you can your reading proficiency was fluently. A book Understanding China's Legal System will make you
to end up being smarter. You can feel considerably more confidence if you can know about almost
everything. But some of you think this open or reading some sort of book make you bored. It isn't make you
fun. Why they might be thought like that? Have you trying to find best book or appropriate book with you?

Timothy Brown:

In this 21st centuries, people become competitive in most way. By being competitive currently, people have
do something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place and notice by
simply surrounding. One thing that oftentimes many people have underestimated this for a while is reading.
Yep, by reading a e-book your ability to survive increase then having chance to stay than other is high. For
you personally who want to start reading any book, we give you this specific Understanding China's Legal
System book as basic and daily reading e-book. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Tenesha Little:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also get a life style. This reading habit give
you lot of advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge the particular information inside
the book that improve your knowledge and information. The information you get based on what kind of
reserve you read, if you want attract knowledge just go with knowledge books but if you want experience
happy read one together with theme for entertaining including comic or novel. The actual Understanding
China's Legal System is kind of reserve which is giving the reader erratic experience.

Dianne Haire:

Do you have something that you enjoy such as book? The guide lovers usually prefer to pick book like
comic, small story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not striving Understanding China's Legal
System that give your pleasure preference will be satisfied by means of reading this book. Reading routine
all over the world can be said as the method for people to know world better then how they react to the
world. It can't be said constantly that reading routine only for the geeky man or woman but for all of you
who wants to be success person. So , for all of you who want to start studying as your good habit, you can
pick Understanding China's Legal System become your personal starter.
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