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Outlander fan, you will love this time traveller story

Includes FREE Menage Erotica!

For a limited time only, this book includes another FREE erotic romance!
If you’re an Outlander fan, you will love this time traveller story as we follow Marion on her journey from
our contemporary time, to 18th century Scottish. Marion has now spent three months in her latest time travel
journey to the year 1710 in the Scottish Highlands becoming accustomed to the ways of the Bruce Clan that
have taken her in. It has been uneventful until Bruce Castle is raided and burned to the ground causing
Marion and her trusted new friend the Lady Bruce to flee and take shelter in hiding with the McBride Clan.
The only problem is, the McBride sons, although attractive and fit are most unwelcoming to Marion who
they see as a spoiled outsider putting the McBride Clan in danger. Liam McBride loathes the newcomer who
seems to purposefully do dumb things that put his clan in danger, but when he is up against her wild spirit, he
wants nothing more than to tame her the way he is accustomed to taming the women of the Highlands, he
just has no idea he is dealing with a modern women, with modern ideals. Will their anger and loathing for
each other drive the two clans apart, or will it ignite a fire between them that has Marion’s wondering if she
ever truly wants to return to the twenty first century?

This steamy novel is guaranteed to make your knees quake!

Warning: This book contains Explicit Erotic content and is intended for adult eyes only!

About the author:
Alexandra Stone is the celebrated author of the best-selling shifter-erotica “Bid Bad Wolf”. With several
years of experience as with writing, Alexandra is a seasoned writer who always deliver an engaging and
exciting story and plot!
If you only want to read romance of the highest quality, Alexandra Stone is your go-to author!
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From reader reviews:

Dennis James:

The experience that you get from TIME TRAVEL ROMANCE: If I could turn back time 4 (Historical
Scottish Time Travel Romance BBW) (Sci fi Science Fiction Highlander Time Traveller) is the more deep
you searching the information that hide into the words the more you get serious about reading it. It does not
mean that this book is hard to be aware of but TIME TRAVEL ROMANCE: If I could turn back time 4
(Historical Scottish Time Travel Romance BBW) (Sci fi Science Fiction Highlander Time Traveller) giving
you enjoyment feeling of reading. The article writer conveys their point in selected way that can be
understood by means of anyone who read the idea because the author of this e-book is well-known enough.
This particular book also makes your current vocabulary increase well. So it is easy to understand then can
go along, both in printed or e-book style are available. We advise you for having this particular TIME
TRAVEL ROMANCE: If I could turn back time 4 (Historical Scottish Time Travel Romance BBW) (Sci fi
Science Fiction Highlander Time Traveller) instantly.

Robert Lindsey:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information currently can get by anyone with
everywhere. The information can be a knowledge or any news even a concern. What people must be consider
when those information which is in the former life are difficult to be find than now could be taking seriously
which one is acceptable to believe or which one typically the resource are convinced. If you find the unstable
resource then you understand it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All those
possibilities will not happen with you if you take TIME TRAVEL ROMANCE: If I could turn back time 4
(Historical Scottish Time Travel Romance BBW) (Sci fi Science Fiction Highlander Time Traveller) as your
daily resource information.

Kelsey Jimenez:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style in this era globalization. With studying you can get a lot of
information that will give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world can certainly share their
idea. Publications can also inspire a lot of people. A great deal of author can inspire their particular reader
with their story or maybe their experience. Not only the story that share in the textbooks. But also they write
about advantage about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to
teach your kids, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors on earth always try to improve
their talent in writing, they also doing some exploration before they write on their book. One of them is this
TIME TRAVEL ROMANCE: If I could turn back time 4 (Historical Scottish Time Travel Romance BBW)
(Sci fi Science Fiction Highlander Time Traveller).



Michael Robinson:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information from
the book. Book is composed or printed or descriptive from each source this filled update of news. In this
particular modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for you actually. From media
social similar to newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, new and comic. You
can add your understanding by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just looking
for the TIME TRAVEL ROMANCE: If I could turn back time 4 (Historical Scottish Time Travel Romance
BBW) (Sci fi Science Fiction Highlander Time Traveller) when you desired it?
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