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New to Penguin Classics: two of the most important Buddhist tracts from Japan

Both of these works on life’s fleeting pleasures are by Buddhist monks from medieval Japan, but each
represents a different worldview. In Essays in Idleness, his lively and sometimes ribald collection of
anecdotes, advice, and observations, Kenko displays his fascination with earthly matters. In the short memoir
Hojoki, however, Chomei recounts his decision to withdraw from worldly affairs and live as a hermit.

For more than seventy years, Penguin has been the leading publisher of classic literature in the English-
speaking world. With more than 1,700 titles, Penguin Classics represents a global bookshelf of the best
works throughout history and across genres and disciplines. Readers trust the series to provide authoritative
texts enhanced by introductions and notes by distinguished scholars and contemporary authors, as well as
up-to-date translations by award-winning translators.
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From reader reviews:

Dora Bair:

Reading can called brain hangout, why? Because when you find yourself reading a book specifically book
entitled Essays in Idleness and Hojoki (Penguin Classics) your thoughts will drift away trough every
dimension, wandering in most aspect that maybe not known for but surely might be your mind friends.
Imaging just about every word written in a reserve then become one web form conclusion and explanation
that will maybe you never get prior to. The Essays in Idleness and Hojoki (Penguin Classics) giving you a
different experience more than blown away your head but also giving you useful facts for your better life
with this era. So now let us show you the relaxing pattern at this point is your body and mind will likely be
pleased when you are finished studying it, like winning a game. Do you want to try this extraordinary
wasting spare time activity?

Steven Ellison:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 as well as 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind
ability or thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book as
compared to can satisfy your short time to read it because pretty much everything time you only find
publication that need more time to be learn. Essays in Idleness and Hojoki (Penguin Classics) can be your
answer because it can be read by a person who have those short time problems.

Peter Robey:

As a scholar exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the library or
even make summary for some reserve, they are complained. Just small students that has reading's heart or
real their hobby. They just do what the educator want, like asked to go to the library. They go to at this time
there but nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that reading is not important, boring and can't see
colorful pics on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important for yourself. As we know that
on this time, many ways to get whatever we wish. Likewise word says, many ways to reach Chinese's
country. Therefore , this Essays in Idleness and Hojoki (Penguin Classics) can make you experience more
interested to read.

Wayne Kong:

Many people said that they feel weary when they reading a reserve. They are directly felt the item when they
get a half areas of the book. You can choose the actual book Essays in Idleness and Hojoki (Penguin
Classics) to make your current reading is interesting. Your personal skill of reading proficiency is developing
when you just like reading. Try to choose basic book to make you enjoy to see it and mingle the idea about
book and looking at especially. It is to be 1st opinion for you to like to open up a book and learn it. Beside
that the reserve Essays in Idleness and Hojoki (Penguin Classics) can to be your new friend when you're
experience alone and confuse with what must you're doing of the time.
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