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Skirt-chasing, orchid-raising Florida judge "Maximum" Bob Gibbs has made a career of oversentencing
convicted felons. He's thrown the book at so many that it's beginning to look like one of them may be
planning to throw it back at him. But assassination isn't the worst of the judge's problems. He's got to get his
whacked-out wife Leanne out of Palm Beach--fast. For it seems she's becoming an embarrassment, what
with her multiple personalities and all. So when Bob starts playing footsie with an alligator poacher in a
scam to scare his wife into divorce, and a pretty probation officer named Kathy Diaz Baker catches his
lecherous eye, things really start to heat up in south Florida...as bullets start flying, a gator comes crawling,
and a lovely lady finds herself in a cross fire of smart crooks, foolish love, and sweet revenge.
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From reader reviews:

Debbie Bennett:

Throughout other case, little individuals like to read book Maximum Bob. You can choose the best book if
you'd prefer reading a book. Providing we know about how is important some sort of book Maximum Bob.
You can add expertise and of course you can around the world by the book. Absolutely right, mainly because
from book you can know everything! From your country till foreign or abroad you can be known. About
simple matter until wonderful thing you may know that. In this era, we can easily open a book or searching
by internet device. It is called e-book. You can use it when you feel bored stiff to go to the library. Let's
examine.

Nannie Hernandez:

Here thing why this Maximum Bob are different and reliable to be yours. First of all examining a book is
good nonetheless it depends in the content than it which is the content is as tasty as food or not. Maximum
Bob giving you information deeper and different ways, you can find any reserve out there but there is no
guide that similar with Maximum Bob. It gives you thrill reading journey, its open up your personal eyes
about the thing which happened in the world which is perhaps can be happened around you. You can bring
everywhere like in park your car, café, or even in your method home by train. If you are having difficulties in
bringing the imprinted book maybe the form of Maximum Bob in e-book can be your alternate.

Barbara Akins:

Beside this particular Maximum Bob in your phone, it might give you a way to get closer to the new
knowledge or data. The information and the knowledge you can got here is fresh through the oven so don't
possibly be worry if you feel like an outdated people live in narrow village. It is good thing to have
Maximum Bob because this book offers for your requirements readable information. Do you often have book
but you rarely get what it's interesting features of. Oh come on, that will not happen if you have this with
your hand. The Enjoyable blend here cannot be questionable, including treasuring beautiful island. So do you
still want to miss it? Find this book as well as read it from today!

Marcos Hawkins:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book will filled the space in your house, you might have it in e-
book means, more simple and reachable. This particular Maximum Bob can give you a lot of good friends
because by you taking a look at this one book you have matter that they don't and make anyone more like an
interesting person. That book can be one of one step for you to get success. This e-book offer you
information that possibly your friend doesn't understand, by knowing more than various other make you to
be great folks. So , why hesitate? We need to have Maximum Bob.
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