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Ex-NYPD cop turned P. I. and entrepreneur, Moe Prager is faced with a gut-wrenching case. The apparent
suicide of his old friend and NYPD Chief of Detectives, Larry McDonald, forces Moe back onto the
decaying Coney Island streets he patrolled when he was in uniform. But now, beneath the boardwalk and
behind the rusted and crumbling rides of the midway, he finds a trail of death, betrayal, and corruption
reaching back to 1972. As Faulkner once said, "The past is never dead. It isn't even past". So it goes for Moe
Prager in Soul Patch.
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From reader reviews:

Deborah Tate:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be upgrade about what going on or details even
knowledge to make these keep up with the era that is certainly always change and move forward. Some of
you maybe will update themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice for yourself but the
problems coming to you is you don't know what kind you should start with. This Soul Patch is our
recommendation so you keep up with the world. Why, since this book serves what you want and wish in this
era.

Myrtle Hamer:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation as well as go to the outside with them family or
their friend. Do you know? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching TV, or maybe playing
video games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity here is look different you can read some
sort of book. It is really fun for yourself. If you enjoy the book that you read you can spent 24 hours a day to
reading a publication. The book Soul Patch it doesn't matter what good to read. There are a lot of those who
recommended this book. They were enjoying reading this book. When you did not have enough space to
bring this book you can buy often the e-book. You can m0ore quickly to read this book from a smart phone.
The price is not to fund but this book has high quality.

Gail Brasfield:

Reading a book to get new life style in this season; every people loves to examine a book. When you read a
book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge, mainly because
book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of book that
you have read. If you need to get information about your analysis, you can read education books, but if you
want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, these us novel, comics, in addition to soon. The Soul
Patch will give you new experience in reading through a book.

Earnest Koontz:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information
originating from a book. Book is written or printed or outlined from each source that will filled update of
news. Within this modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for a person. From
media social just like newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and comic.
You can add your understanding by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to spread out your
book? Or just searching for the Soul Patch when you desired it?
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