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Many recent books have documented the collaboration of the French authorities with the anti-Jewish German
policies of World War II. Yet about 76 percent of France’s Jews survived—more than in almost any other
country in Western Europe. How do we explain this phenomenon? Certainly not by looking at official
French policy, for the Vichy government began preparing racial laws even before the German occupiers had
decreed such laws. To provide a full answer to the question of how so many French Jews survived, Susan
Zuccotti examines the response of the French people to the Holocaust. Drawing on memoirs, government
documents, and personal interviews with survivors, she tells the stories of ordinary and extraordinary French
men and women. Zuccotti argues that the French reaction to the Holocaust was not as reprehensible as it has
been portrayed.
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From reader reviews:

Donald Howard:

Book is written, printed, or created for everything. You can understand everything you want by a book. Book
has a different type. We all know that that book is important matter to bring us around the world. Close to
that you can your reading talent was fluently. A e-book The Holocaust, the French, and the Jews will make
you to always be smarter. You can feel more confidence if you can know about everything. But some of you
think that open or reading any book make you bored. It is not make you fun. Why they can be thought like
that? Have you looking for best book or acceptable book with you?

Joshua Stamper:

The reserve with title The Holocaust, the French, and the Jews includes a lot of information that you can
understand it. You can get a lot of gain after read this book. That book exist new knowledge the information
that exist in this guide represented the condition of the world right now. That is important to yo7u to find out
how the improvement of the world. This book will bring you within new era of the the positive effect. You
can read the e-book with your smart phone, so you can read it anywhere you want.

Douglas Johnson:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them household or
their friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching TV, or playing video
games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity that's look different you can read some sort of book.
It is really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book that you read you can spent the whole day to reading
a publication. The book The Holocaust, the French, and the Jews it is quite good to read. There are a lot of
folks that recommended this book. These folks were enjoying reading this book. If you did not have enough
space to develop this book you can buy the particular e-book. You can m0ore simply to read this book from
the smart phone. The price is not to cover but this book features high quality.

Richard Lamm:

Playing with family within a park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with friends is thing that
usually you may have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try issue that really
opposite from that. A single activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you already been ride on and with addition of information. Even you love The Holocaust, the French,
and the Jews, it is possible to enjoy both. It is very good combination right, you still need to miss it? What
kind of hang-out type is it? Oh can occur its mind hangout guys. What? Still don't understand it, oh come on
its referred to as reading friends.
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