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“It’s fun to find ways I’m like you and you’re like me. It’s fun to find ways we’re different.” In this colorful,
inviting English-Spanish book, kids from preschool to lower elementary learn about diversity in terms they
can understand: hair that’s straight or curly, families with many people or few, bodies that are big or small.
With its wide-ranging examples and fun, highly detailed art, I’m Like You, You’re Like Me/ Yo soy como tú,
tú eres como yo helps kids appreciate the ways they are alike and affirm their individual differences. A
section for adults in the back provides tips and activities (in both English and Spanish) for parents and
caregivers to reinforce the themes and lessons of the book.
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From reader reviews:

Regina Rodgers:

The book I'm Like You, You’re Like Me / Yo soy como tú, tú eres como yo: A Book About Understanding
and Appreciating Each Other/Un libro para entendernos y apreciarnos (English and Spanish Edition) make
one feel enjoy for your spare time. You may use to make your capable more increase. Book can to become
your best friend when you getting strain or having big problem with the subject. If you can make looking at a
book I'm Like You, You’re Like Me / Yo soy como tú, tú eres como yo: A Book About Understanding and
Appreciating Each Other/Un libro para entendernos y apreciarnos (English and Spanish Edition) to be your
habit, you can get far more advantages, like add your capable, increase your knowledge about some or all
subjects. You could know everything if you like start and read a e-book I'm Like You, You’re Like Me / Yo
soy como tú, tú eres como yo: A Book About Understanding and Appreciating Each Other/Un libro para
entendernos y apreciarnos (English and Spanish Edition). Kinds of book are several. It means that, science
publication or encyclopedia or others. So , how do you think about this guide?

Shannon Blackshear:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to perform! A lot of people spent their spare time with their family, or
their own friends. Usually they undertaking activity like watching television, planning to beach, or picnic
from the park. They actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Do you wish to something
different to fill your current free time/ holiday? May be reading a book can be option to fill your free of
charge time/ holiday. The first thing that you will ask may be what kinds of guide that you should read. If
you want to attempt look for book, may be the e-book untitled I'm Like You, You’re Like Me / Yo soy como
tú, tú eres como yo: A Book About Understanding and Appreciating Each Other/Un libro para entendernos y
apreciarnos (English and Spanish Edition) can be great book to read. May be it is usually best activity to you.

Carlos Callahan:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind
proficiency or thinking skill even analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book than
can satisfy your short space of time to read it because all of this time you only find guide that need more time
to be examine. I'm Like You, You’re Like Me / Yo soy como tú, tú eres como yo: A Book About
Understanding and Appreciating Each Other/Un libro para entendernos y apreciarnos (English and Spanish
Edition) can be your answer as it can be read by an individual who have those short free time problems.

Donald Lee:

Beside this particular I'm Like You, You’re Like Me / Yo soy como tú, tú eres como yo: A Book About
Understanding and Appreciating Each Other/Un libro para entendernos y apreciarnos (English and Spanish
Edition) in your phone, it could give you a way to get more close to the new knowledge or facts. The



information and the knowledge you will got here is fresh from the oven so don't always be worry if you feel
like an previous people live in narrow small town. It is good thing to have I'm Like You, You’re Like Me /
Yo soy como tú, tú eres como yo: A Book About Understanding and Appreciating Each Other/Un libro para
entendernos y apreciarnos (English and Spanish Edition) because this book offers for your requirements
readable information. Do you at times have book but you seldom get what it's all about. Oh come on, that
will not happen if you have this inside your hand. The Enjoyable blend here cannot be questionable,
including treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you still want to miss that? Find this book and read it from
right now!
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